
ADDRESS

Grange Grove, Canonbury, London N1

PR ICE

£3,500,000

DES IGNER
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I N F O R M AT I O N

Set within the leafy and architectural ly  r ich
Canonbury Conservation Area, this
beautiful ly  restored 1840s townhouse
unfolds across four thoughtful ly  arranged
floors, offering over 2,200 sq ft  of  ref ined
living space. The home balances heritage
and contemporary craftsmanship with quiet
poise, comprising f ive bedrooms, three
bathrooms, and a considered palette of
materials and f inishes throughout.

On the ground f loor, a l ight-f i l led reception
room sits to the front of  the house, where
original  detai l ing -  sash windows, intr icate
cei l ing rose, decorative coving, and a
marble f i replace, echo the home’s 19th-
century origins. A generous kitchen and
dining area has been extended with
architectural  precision, featuring bespoke
cabinetry by Roundhouse, a marble island,
Corian worktops, integrated appliances
including a Miele wine fr idge, and poured
concrete f looring with underf loor heating. A
discreet uti l i ty  area is cleverly concealed
within custom Roundhouse joinery. Ful l-
width sl iding glass doors open onto a
beautiful ly  landscaped garden, perfectly
oriented to the south-west to maximise
natural  l ight. A playroom and guest WC
complete this f loor.

Upstairs, the principal  bedroom spans the
ful l  width of  the house, with dual  sash
windows, original  wooden f loors, bui lt- in
wardrobes and period detai l ing throughout.
The adjacent bathroom features a clawfoot
rol l-top bath, walk-in shower, and a period
fireplace thoughtful ly  retained. A study at
the rear overlooks the garden below.

The second f loor offers two further
bedrooms and a family bathroom, f inished
with Duravit  f i tt ings. The top f loor has been
extended to accommodate a spacious
double bedroom with en-suite shower room
and eaves storage, making excel lent use of
the roofl ine.
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